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1207, 738 1 Avenue SW
Calgary, Alberta

MLS # A2142010

$5,000,000
Eau Claire

Residential/High Rise (5+ stories)

High-Rise (5+)

2,532 sq.ft.

2

Enclosed, Heated Garage, Oversized, Parkade, See Remarks, Titled, Underground

-

-

2019 (5 yrs old)

2 full / 1 half

2019 (5 yrs old)

2 full / 1 half

Forced Air

Ceramic Tile, Hardwood

Rubber

-

Concrete, Glass

-

Bookcases, Breakfast Bar, Built-in Features, Closet Organizers, Double Vanity, Elevator, Kitchen Island, Separate Entrance, Stone
Counters, Walk-In Closet(s)

a microwave oven,  deluxe coffee machine,  electric vehicle charging plug in

-

-

$ 2,513

-

DC (pre 1P2007)

-

Welcome to The Concord, where luxury living reaches new heights along the serene riverfront. This stunning 2-bedroom, 3-bath high-rise
condo offers an unparalleled living experience for those who seek opulence and the embrace of nature. With breathtaking views of the
river and city skyline, this residence promises elegance and tranquility. Arrive in style with a private elevator that grants direct access to
your luxurious abode, ensuring utmost ease, security, and privacy. As you step into this spacious and meticulously designed condo,
you're greeted by an open-concept living and dining area featuring floor-to-ceiling windows. These windows bathe the space in natural
light and offer captivating views of the winding river and lush greenery, creating a seamless connection with nature. The kitchen is a
gourmet's dream, equipped with top-of-the-line stainless steel Miele appliances, sleek marble countertops, and smooth carbon fiber
cabinetry designed by Porsche. Picture yourself preparing meals in this culinary haven, with the stunning river views adding an extra
touch of delight to every culinary experience. The master bedroom is a sanctuary of tranquility. Imagine unwinding in a spa-like en-suite
bath featuring a deep soaking tub, a separate glass-enclosed steam shower, dual vanities adorned with luxurious fixtures, and marble
walls and floors. The master suite also offers direct access to an expansive deck, perfect for enjoying the serene surroundings. The
second bedroom is equally well-appointed, with an adjacent full bath, ideal for guests or family members. Just outside the bedrooms,
you'll find a versatile den, perfect for a home office, library, or cozy retreat. The condo also includes a fully equipped laundry room with a
full-size washer, dryer, and sink. An office with built-ins off the living room provides a dedicated workspace. Step onto your beautiful



oversized terrace, which overlooks the Bow River and the Peace Bridge. This outdoor space is perfect for morning coffee or evening
gatherings, featuring two gas heaters, a full outdoor kitchen with a BBQ, sink, and side burners, a water connection for a hot tub, pots with
fully irrigated trees, and a gas connection for a fire table. Additionally, this unit comes with a private 4-car garage with ample height for car
lifts. The garage features custom cabinetry for additional storage and one of a very limited number of electric vehicle charging plugs in the
building,and a separate storage locker provides even more space. The Concord's amenities are endless, including a 24-hour concierge
and security, a summer water garden, a winter skating rink, a lounge, a kitchen, a full fitness facility, and car washes. The building is
constructed with long-lasting concrete, double-glazed windows, and a superior infrastructure designed for flood and emergency
preparedness. Located just steps from Prince's Island Park, the River Pathway System, and downtown, this residence offers urban luxury
living at its finest.
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